
Exam in pedagogy - topics: 
 
 
Pedagogy 
  

- Scientific field of pedagogy. Historical development of pedagogy as a science. The            
subject of pedagogy, its functions and stages of development. Approaches to the            
system of pedagogical disciplines. The relationship of pedagogy to other sciences. The            
relationship between pedagogical theory and practice. Current problems and issues of           
pedagogy. 

- Quantitative and qualitative research in pedagogy (basic characteristics of both          
approaches, their comparison, pros, cons).  

- Methods of quantitative and qualitative research in pedagogy (basic characteristics of           
selected methods and their use). 

- Formative factors of individuals - biological factors, environment, education.         
Pedagogical teleology - goals of education in various pedagogical concepts. Functions           
of educational goals, their classification and structure. 

- Analysis of the educational process - stages of the educational process, educational            
principles, effectiveness of the educational process. 

- Basics of statistics in pedagogically oriented research (selection of elements for the            
research sample, measurement in pedagogical research and types of variables). 

- System of the Czech curricular documents. Explanation of terms: key competencies,           
professional competencies, educational area, cross-curricular themes, graduate profile. 

- The personality of the teacher and educator. Requirements for the personality of            
teachers and educators, the social role of teachers and educators, current issues of the              
teaching profession. Discipline and authority in education. Possibilities of reflection          
and self-reflection and problems of burnout syndrome of pedagogical staff. 

- The personality of the educated individual and his/her individuality. Educability of           
man. Interaction of the educator and the educated. Educational work with individuals            
with specific needs, integration issues. 

- Pedagogical communication (verbal, nonverbal). Paralinguistic expressions and       
communication in teaching. Barriers in pedagogical communication. Assertiveness. 

- The most common data processing procedures in pedagogical research (frequencies,          
graphical representations, position characteristics, standard deviation). 

- Issues of social pathological phenomena from a pedagogical point of view. Prevention            
system. Battered Child Syndrome (Child abuse and neglect) from a pedagogical point            
of view. 

- Key competencies in Framework Educational Programme. Structure and properties of          
learning objectives. Learning tasks and their functions in teaching. 

- Teaching methods and their classification. Material teaching aids and aspects of their            
selection. 

- Organizational forms of teaching and their classification. Advantages and         
disadvantages of individual forms of teaching. 

- Diagnostic approaches and methods in pedagogy. Evaluation as a pedagogical          
problem. Examination, preparation for oral and written examinations. Didactic test and           
problems of its creation and evaluation. 

- The environment of the school and other educational institutions. School climate.           
Inspiration by alternative pedagogical systems for streamlining the educational         
process. 



- Lifelong learning, its characteristics, stages, ways of implementation, barriers.         
Importance and possibilities of lifelong education of pedagogical staff. The system of            
further education of pedagogical staff. 

- Current trends in the educational policy of the Czech Republic (analysis of the key              
documents). 

- Importance of ISCED, clarification of basic classification according to levels of           
education (assign corresponding types of Czech schools to individual levels). School           
system in the Czech Republic (founders of schools and school institutions). 

- Characteristics of basic trends of changes in education in the historical context of             
contemporary paradigms (conception of man and education, goals of education).          
Reflections of contemporary concepts of education at present. 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 


